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MONDAY TUESDAY WEDNESDAY THURSDAY FRIDAY SATURDAYSUNDAY

54321 6

7 8 9 10 11 12 13

14 15 17 18 19 20

21 22 23 24 25 26 27

28

• �Last day to drop  
courses without   
“WD” grade in  
Cyberfriar for undergraduate 
students

• �Last day for election of  
audit option

• �Last day to add courses 
without charge

29 30

ROSH HASHANAH

Late adjustment period 
begins for undergraduate 
students

Administrative adjustment 
period begins for  
undergraduates

All undergraduate, graduate 
and SCE courses begin

Last day to withdraw from 
classes with partial refund 
for graduate and SCE 
students

Last day for online course 
additions on Cyberfriar for 
undergraduate students

��• �LABOR DAY HOLIDAY

��• �Offices closed

��• �New Student Orientation

• �All sophomore, junior, and 
senior residents move in

16
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MONDAY TUESDAY WEDNESDAY THURSDAY FRIDAY SATURDAYSUNDAY

321 4

5 6 7 8 9 10 11

12 13 14 16 17 18

19 20 21 23 24 25

26 27 28 29 30 31

YOM KIPPUR

• �Last day for submission of 
mid-semester grades

• �Fall President/Provost/All 
Faculty Meeting 3:30 p.m. 
Ruane 105

• �Mid-semester date  
for undergraduate 
courses

• �Last day to submit course-
work to instructor for “I” and 
“NM” grades for Spring and 
Summer 2025

All classes resume

MONDAY CLASS  
SCHEDULE TO BE  
FOLLOWED FOR ALL 
COURSES

COLUMBUS DAY HOLIDAY

Offices closed

All classes suspended

22

15

25162_REG_2025-2026_Academic_Calendar_v9.indd   325162_REG_2025-2026_Academic_Calendar_v9.indd   3 7/31/25   11:06 AM7/31/25   11:06 AM



25

notes

MONDAY TUESDAY WEDNESDAY THURSDAY FRIDAY SATURDAYSUNDAY

1

2 3 4 5 6 7 8

9 10 11 12 13 14 15

16 17 18 19 20 21 22

2923

30

24 25 26 27 28
THANKSGIVING DAY  
HOLIDAY

Offices closed

All classes suspended

Thanksgiving Recess

Offices closed

All classes suspended

Course registration for Class 
of 2026 and December 2026 
graduates

Thanksgiving Recess

Offices closed

SOLEMNITY OF ALL 
SAINTS

Thanksgiving Recess

Offices closed

All classes suspended

Course registration for Class 
of 2029 and December 2029 
graduates

Fall Faculty/Staff Meeting, 
3:30 p.m., Slavin Center,  
’64 Hall

Course registration for Class 
of 2028 and December 2028 
graduates

Last day to elect pass/fail 
option (option for Class of 
2029 begins with the second 
semester)

Course registration for Class 
of 2027 and December 2027 
graduates

Thanksgiving Recess
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MONDAY TUESDAY WEDNESDAY THURSDAY FRIDAY SATURDAYSUNDAY

54321 6

7 8 9 10 11

14 15 16 17 18 19 20

21 22 23 24 25 26 27

28 29 30 31

• �CHRISTMAS DAY  
HOLIDAY

�• �Offices closed

Fall semester examination 
period for undergraduate, 
graduate, and SCE courses

Christmas Recess

Offices closed

Fall semester examination 
period for undergraduate 
courses

�Undergraduate classes for 
Fall semester end after 
last class

Last day to withdraw with 
“WD” with permission,  
applicable to all schools

Christmas Recess

Offices closed

Fall semester examination 
period for graduate and SCE 
courses

• �Reading day for undergradu-
ate students

• �SCE and graduate classes for 
Fall semester end after last 
classes

Christmas Recess

Offices closed

��Christmas Recess

Offices closed

Fall semester examination 
period for undergraduate, 
graduate, and SCE courses

Christmas Recess

Offices closed

Fall semester examination 
period for undergraduate, 
graduate, and SCE courses

Christmas Recess

Offices closed

Winter Session begins

• �Fall semester examination 
period for DWC courses

• �Fall semester examina-
tion for SCE and graduate 
courses

• �HANUKKAH

SOLEMNITY OF THE  
IMMACULATE  
CONCEPTION

All classes resume

Registration for Winter and 
Spring graduate and SCE 
courses begin at 9 a.m.

Christmas Recess

Offices closed

Reading day for  
undergraduates

12 13
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21 3

4 5 6 7 8 9 10

11 12 13 14 15 16 17

18 19 20 21 22 23 24

3125 27 28 29

��• �NEW YEAR’S DAY  
HOLIDAY

���• �Offices closed

• �SOLEMNITY OF MARY, 
MOTHER OF GOD

Last day to withdraw from 
classes with partial refund 
for graduate and SCE 
students

Winter Session ends

Late adjustment period 
begins for undergraduate 
students

Administrative adjustment  
period begins for  
undergraduates

• �Last day to 
drop courses 
without a “WD” 
grade in Cyberfriar for 
undergraduate students 

• �Last day for election of 
audit option

• �Last day to add courses 
without charge

�• All classes resume

• �Last day for online course 
additions on Cyberfriar for  
undergraduate students

MARTIN LUTHER KING JR. 
HOLIDAY

Offices closed

All classes suspended

All undergraduate, graduate, 
and SCE courses begin
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MONDAY TUESDAY WEDNESDAY THURSDAY FRIDAY SATURDAYSUNDAY

654321 7

8 9 10 11 12 13 14

15 16 17 18 19 20 21

22 23 24 25 26 27 28
• �Mid-semester date for 

undergraduate courses 

• �Last day to submit course-
work to instructor for “I” 
and “NM” grades for Fall 
2025 and Winter 2026

ASH WEDNESDAYAll classes resume

MONDAY CLASS  
SCHEDULE TO BE  
FOLLOWED FOR ALL 
COURSES

PRESIDENTS’ DAY  
HOLIDAY

Offices closed

All classes suspended
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MONDAY TUESDAY WEDNESDAY THURSDAY FRIDAY SATURDAYSUNDAY

654321 7

8 9 10 11 12 13 14

15 16 17 19 20 21

22 23 24 25 26 27 28

29 30 31

Spring Recess

All classes suspended

Spring Recess

All classes suspended

Spring Recess

All classes suspended

Spring Recess

All classes suspended

�• �Last day for election of  
pass/fail option

• �Spring President/Provost/
All Faculty Meeting,  
3:30 p.m., Ruane 105

Spring Recess

All classes suspended

�Last day for submission of 
mid-semester grades 

Spring Recess

All classes suspended

All classes resume

Spring Recess

All classes suspended

Spring Recess

Spring Recess

18
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MONDAY TUESDAY WEDNESDAY THURSDAY FRIDAY SATURDAYSUNDAY

321 4

5 6 7 8 9 10 11

12 13 14 15 16 17 18

19 20 21 22 23 24 25

26 27 28 29 30

• �HOLY THURSDAY

• �PASSOVER

• �Easter Recess

• �All classes suspended

Last day to withdraw with 
“WD,” applicable to all 
schools

• �GOOD FRIDAY

• �Easter Recess

• �Offices closed

• �All classes suspended

Easter Recess 

All classes suspended

• �Course registration for 
Class of 2029 and Decem-
ber 2029 graduates

• �Spring Faculty/Staff  
Meeting, 3:30 p.m.,  
Slavin Center, ’64 Hall

�MONDAY CLASS SCHEDULE 
TO BE FOLLOWED FOR ALL 
COURSES

Course registration for Class 
of 2028 and December 2028 
graduates

All classes resume

Course registration for 
December 2026 graduates, 
Class of 2027 and December 
2027 graduates

Easter Recess 

All classes suspended

EASTER SUNDAY
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• �Reading day for un-
dergraduate students

• �SCE and graduate 
classes for Spring semester 
end after last classes

• �Graduate students: Last day to 
submit coursework to instruc-
tors for “I” and “NM” grades 
for Fall 2025
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MONDAY TUESDAY WEDNESDAY THURSDAY FRIDAY SATURDAYSUNDAY

1 2

3 4 5 6 7 8 9

10 11 12 13 14 15 16

17 18 19 20 21 22 23

3024

31

25 26 27 28 29

• ASCENSION THURSDAY

• �Commencement for  
graduate and SCE  
students

Spring semester examination  
period for undergraduate, 
graduate, and SCE courses

Maymester ends

ROTC Commissioning

Spring semester examination  
period for undergraduate 
courses

Undergraduate classes for 
spring semester end after 
last class

• �Academic Awards  
Ceremony

• �Commencement Mass

• Family Reception

Spring semester examination 
period for graduate and SCE 
courses

Spring semester examination  
period for undergraduate, 
graduate, and SCE courses

Summer I courses begin

Spring semester examination 
period for undergraduate, 
graduate, and SCE courses

MEMORIAL DAY HOLIDAY

Offices closed

Maymester begins

• �Spring semester  
examination period for 
DWC courses 

• �Spring semester  
examination for SCE and 
graduate courses

PENTECOST 

�Commencement for  
undergraduate students 
Amica Mutual Pavilion,  
10:30 a.m.

Reading day for  
undergraduate students
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MONDAY TUESDAY WEDNESDAY THURSDAY FRIDAY SATURDAYSUNDAY

54321 6

7 8 9 10 11 12 13

14 15 16 17 18 19 20

21 22 23 24 25 26 27

28 29 30

Summer I courses end

JUNETEENTH HOLIDAY

Offices closed

All classes suspended

Summer II courses begin

Graduate Theology courses 
begin
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321 4
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Summer II courses end

Graduate Theology courses 
end (make-up day for  
Independence Day holiday 
at the discretion of the 
instructor)

INDEPENDENCE DAY 
HOLIDAY
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MONDAY TUESDAY WEDNESDAY THURSDAY FRIDAY SATURDAYSUNDAY

1

2 3 4 5 6 7 8

9 10 11 12 13 14 15

16 17 18 19 20 21 22

2923

30 31

24 25 26 27 28

SOLEMNITY OF  
THE ASSUMPTION

SOLEMNITY OF  
ST. DOMINIC
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